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Malaysian developers 
are more optimistic 
about the outlook for 
the property indus-
try in the second half 
of this year (2H2021) 

than in 1H2021. The economy is 
expected to recover and boost buy-
ing sentiment in the latter half of 
the year. 

In a survey conducted by the 
Real Estate and Housing Develop-
ers' Association (Rehda) Malaysia, 
20% and 26% of the 134 respondents 
were optimistic about the property 
market/sales performance and res-
idential sector growth respectively 
in 2H2021, compared with only 8% 
for both in 1H2021. 

Rehda president Datuk Soam 
Heng Choon said in a March 30 
media briefing that the vaccine 
rollout will improve the country's 
economic outlook and, ultimately, 
spur the local property market. Also 
present at the event were Rehda 
deputy president Datuk N K Tong, 
vice-presidents Datuk Zaini Yusoff, 
Datuk Ho Hon Sang and Zulkifly 
Garib and secretary-general Datuk 
Charlie Chia. 

Meanwhile, the survey showed 
that a total of 13,037 units had been 
planned for launch in 1H2021, com-
prising 12,874 residential units 
(6,998 strata units and 5,876 landed 
units) and 163 commercial units.Of 

the respondents with future launch-
es, 83% said they foresee take-up 
rates of 50% and below for the first 
six months of the year. 

Respondents from Kedah/Perlis, 
Negeri Sembilan, Pahang and Sel-
angor planned to launch residen-
tial units in the range of RM250,001 
to RM500,000, while those from 
Johor, Penang and Kuala Lumpur 
aimed to offer units priced between 
RM500,001 and RM700,000. 

As for the economic and business 
outlook for the year, the respondents 
were neutral as there were concerns 
about consumers' purchasing power 
in lH2021.The same sentiment ap-
plied to the growth of the property 
industry, specifically the residential 
sector. However, there was increased 
optimism for 2H2021. 

Some 12,640 residential units 
were launched in 2H2020, compared 
with 12,556 in 2H2019. The most 
popular offerings were 2- and 3-sto-
rey terraced houses (4,120 units), 
followed by serviced apartments 
(3,250 units) and apartments/con-
dominiums (3,059 units). 

Soam said 80.8% of the units 
l a u n c h e d were pr iced f r o m 
RM250,001 to RM700,000 as de-
velopers were aware of buyers' af-
fordability issues. "The sales perfor-
mance was also better in 2H2020, 
increasing from 43% in 2H2019 to 
45% during the period in review. 
Of the 5,736 residential units sold, 
2,467 were 2- and 3-storey terraced 
houses,making them the most pop-
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Soam: The sales performance was 
better in 2H2020, increasing from 
43% in 2H2019 to 45% during the 
period in review 

ular choice. The second and third 
top-performing types in 2H2020 
were serviced apartments (1,225 
units) and apartments/condomin-
iums (1,082 units)." 

First-time homebuyers made up 
the majority of purchasers during 
the period in review. The homes 
were purchased for their own use, 
for family members or as an in-
vestment. 

In terms of unsold units, the sur-
vey showed that 64% and 33% of the 
respondents had unsold residential 
and commercial units respectively 
in 2H2020 compared with 71% and 
42% in 2H2019. "This was probably 
due to the fewer number of units 
launched in 2H2020 as the result of 
the pandemic," said Soam. 

The residential type with the 
highest percentage of unsold units 
was terraced houses (30%), followed 
by semi-detached homes and bun-
galows (29%), apartments/condo-
miniums (26%), serviced apartments 
(8%), cluster and townhouses (5%) 
and low-cost houses (2%). 

Soam said a possible reason for 

the unsold terraced houses was that 
they were not in strategic locations 
with easy access to amenities and 
highways. "End financing issues 
affected most of the respondents in 
2H2020. About 41% of them experi-
enced more than 30% rejections for 
loans applied in 2H2020 due to the 
lower margin of financing offered, 
whereas 40% of respondents had 
more than 30% rejections for loans 
applied because of the ineligibility 
of the buyers' income. Other rea-
sons were unreleased bumiputera 
units and low demand/interest in 
properties that were not strategi-
cally located." 

Some 51% of respondents indi-
cated that the overall cost of doing 
business had increased by 12% in 
2H2020. About 98% of them had 
been affected by the economic situ-
ation, while those that were highly 
and severely affected increased to 
42% from 26% in 2H2019. "Hence, 
some cost-cutting measures were 
implemented, including freezing 
new recruitment, fewer benefits/ 
perks for employees and salary 
reduction, all of which were nec-
essary measures to stay afloat," 
said Soam. 

He added that developers are 
also likely to keep in view or replan 
project launches, reduce the scale 
of the launches and/or delay project 
launches and delivery. Compliance 
costs remained a key factor that af-
fected cash flow, followed by mate-
rial, labour and land costs. 0 
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